


1. General characteristics of the Polish
chemical market

The Polish chemical industry is basically
divided into three production segments:

The chemical industry is one of the most
automated sectors. It requires much
more investment than most other sec-
tors. The chemical industry also requires
highly-qualified personnel including sci-
entists and engineers. The number of
staff is not as important in this sector as
their qualifications and know-how. 
Chemical production is focused on
semi-processed products which are then
used in other industrial sectors. One of
the biggest issues that this sector faces
is its negative external effect on the
environment, as it produces tons of
aggressive and dangerous wastes and
pollutants.

2. Sold production of chemical industry
in Poland

The total value of sold production of
Polish industry in 2007 was PLN
835,014 million, of which 10.78%
came from the chemical sector. The sold
production of chemicals in 2007 grew
by 5.7% in comparison with 2006.

3. Polish chemical industry’s position on
the EU market

4. Chemical production in Europe
The chemical industry in Europe is one
of the most important sectors of the
economy. Production of basic chemi-
cals is dominant in the sector, followed
by production of plastic goods, and the
last main sub-sector is the pharmaceuti-
cal industry. The European Union is the
biggest chemical goods producer in the
world, followed by the United States
and Japan, which results from the high
volume of chemical production in such
European Union countries as Germany,
France, Italy and the United Kingdom.
Those countries combined contribute as
much as 68% of the total EU chemical
production in volume.
In total there are about 31,000 chemi-
cal businesses registered in Europe,
most of which are small and medium-
sized companies employing fewer than
250 people.1

2006 witnessed an increase in chemi-
cal production in EU countries by 2.6%
in comparison with 2005. 
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1 „The European chemical industry, A global leader in
innovation, supporting growth and well-being in

Europe” Cefic, 2008



5. General characteristics of Poland’s
chemical sector

In Poland there were 1.947 companies
registered in the chemical industry in
2006. Number of employees in the sec-
tor in 2006 was 79,988.6 persons.
Sold production of chemical goods in
value in 2007 grew by 9.5% in com-
parison with 2006, to PLN 90,054.4
million. The highest growth was noted
in the production of pesticides, paints
and varnishes, rubber goods (especial-
ly tires) and caustic soda. On the other
hand there was a slight decrease in eth-
ylene, propylene, polypropylene and
caprolactam production.
Export of chemical goods in 2007 was
EUR 101.1 mld, and imports were EUR
118.8 mln. This negative trade bal-
ance highlights the need for further
investment in this sector.

6. Share of the chemical industry in
overall industrial production in
Poland in 2005

Value of sold chemical production
increased by 9.5% in 2007 compared
to 2006. Total chemical production
was PLN 90,054 million, which consti-
tuted 10.78% of overall industry pro-
duction in 2005.

7. Profile of Polish and European chem-
ical industry

The Polish chemical industry is at a sig-
nificantly lower level of development
than its counterparts in other EU coun-

tries. Poland is trying to improve both
production technology and manage-
ment in the chemical industry sector,
however. By participating in UNECE
legislative works, Poland is striving to
implement EU directives in chemical
goods production, and to implement
quality management systems in chemi-

cal production businesses. 

8. Chemical production in Poland
The graph below presents production of
selected chemical goods in Poland in
2007 (in thousand tonnes). The pre-
dominant segment of production is
paints and varnishes. 
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9. Production of principal types of
chemical goods (thousand tonnes)

The highest increase of production was
noted in the mineral and chemical fertil-
izer segment. On the other hand, the
production of polyethylene and
polypropylene faced a slight decrease
in volume. The growth of production of
other chemicals, however, contributed
to the increase in overall chemical
goods production.

10. Producers of chemical goods in
Poland

According to a Ministry of Economy
report, 1,947 companies were regis-
tered in the chemical production sector
in 2006. There were 455 companies
operating in the chemical goods pro-
duction and 1,492 in rubber and plas-
tic goods production. 

11. Employment in the chemical indus-
try

In 2007 average employment in the
chemical industry increased by 4,3%
from 2006. 

12. Labour productivity, salary
Labour productivity in the chemical sec-
tor is growing steadily, with a 3.5%
increase in 2007 in comparison to
2006. The average monthly gross
salary in the chemical industry in 2007
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was PLN 3,671 in production of chem-
ical products, which was over PLN 170
more than in 2006, and PLN 2,3640 in
production of plastic and rubber goods. 

13. Environmental protection in the
chemical industry

The chemical industry is commonly con-
sidered to be one of the most damaging
sectors for the environment. Chemical
companies, however, are making
efforts to introduce modern and envi-
ronment-friendly solutions in order to
protect the environment, and are allo-
cating substantial funds to diagnosis
and research which will result in a
decrease of pollutants and wastes. 
According to national statistics, 1,560
companies were listed as the most
harmful for the environment, only 73 of
which operated in chemical goods pro-
duction and 36 in rubber and plastic

goods production. Many more compa-
nies having a negative influence on the
environment belonged to the groceries
production sector (241), production of
machinery and equipment (92), and
production of basic metals (91). 
The scale of the influence of the chem-

ical industry on the natural environment
can be assessed by such indicators as
air pollution, water consumption, and
volume of wastewater disposal. These
indicators in the chemical goods pro-
duction sector for 2006 are listed in the
tables below. 
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14. Foreign trade
Export and import of chemical products
both grew in 2007. Polish exports were
15% higher, and imports 17,8% high-
er, than in 2006. This was the result of
an insufficient level of chemical produc-
tion in the home market in comparison
to demand. 
The majority of Poland’s chemical pro-
duction was exported to European
Union countries, which accounted for
69% of the total value of chemical
exports in 2005. The EU predominates
also in imports. Imports of chemical
goods from EU countries in 2004 were
76.7% of the total value of imported
chemical goods. 

15. Accession to the EU and regulations
relevant for the chemical sector
The most important EU regulations con-
cerning the chemical sector include:
• Directive 96/61/EC on integrated

prevention and pollution control
(IPPC),

• Directive 85/337/ EEC on the
assessment of the effects of certain
public and private projects on the
environment,

• Directive 97/11/EC amending
Directive 85/337/EEC on the assess-
ment of the effects of certain public
and private projects on the environ-
ment.

16. Most important challenges facing
the chemical industry

• More investment in technological
processes,

• Reduction of foreign trade deficit,
• Closer cooperation with R&D centres, 
• Privatization of the biggest chemical

enterprises,
• Creation of good economic condi-

tions for small and medium-sized
companies operating in the chemical
sector.

17. Production of principal goods sup-
plied by Poland’s largest chemical
enterprises

Regardless of company size or number
of employees, chemical goods produc-
tion in 2006 was dominated by the pro-

duction of rubber and plastic products.
The second biggest production group
was plastic products.   
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18. “Great Chemical Synthesis” pro-
gramme

The Great Chemical Synthesis pro-
gramme is a contractual arrangement
between businesses representing organ-
ics, inorganics, fertilizers, sulphur man-
ufacturing, and the coke-chemical
branch. It includes the largest and most
important businesses of the chemical
industry sector in Poland. 
One of the main goals of the pro-
gramme is restructuring and privatiza-
tion of the Great Chemical Synthesis
businesses by the year 2010. The tasks
facing the enterprises which comprise
the Great Chemical Synthesis pro-
gramme include:

19. Foreign direct investment in chemi-
cal sector in Poland

Source: National Bank of Poland (NBP)

20. Largest foreign investors in chemi-
cal sector in Poland
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21. Base chemicals industry and market
In 2006, comparing to 2001, the num-
ber of companies producing base
chemicals fell by 3, however sold pro-
duction in this segment rose from PLN
10,777 million to PLN 16,356 million,
i.e. by 51,76%. The increase in the
value of sold production was accompa-
nied by a decrease in the number of
employees. 

22. Pharmaceutical industry and mar-
ket

The number of enterprises producing
pharmaceuticals has not changed since
2001. The largest companies in this
sector in Poland in terms of the value of
sold production include GSK Pharma
RX, Polpharma S.A., Servier, Aventis,
Novartis Pharma, Roche, LEK, KRKA,
Sanofi-Synthelabo, Astrazeneca,
Janssen Cilag, Adamed, Novo Nordisk
and Pliva Kraków. The sold production
of this sector rose by PLN 1,876.7 mil-
lion from 2001 to 2006, during which
time employment fell from 23,600 in
2001 to 22,116 in 2006. 

23. Chemical consumer goods industry
and market

50% of the Polish market for chemical
consumer goods is taken by companies
controlled by foreign capital. In 2006
the value of sold production in this sec-
tor was PLN 9,109.6 million. The sector
is dominated by large cosmetics com-
panies which include Avon Cosmetics,
Dr Irena Eris, Oceanic Cosmetic, Ziaja,
Dax Cosmetics and Kolastyna, whose
brands and products are most popular
with Polish consumers. 

24. Paints and varnishes industry and
market

The largest paints and varnishes pro-
ducers in the Polish market are Polifarb
Cieszyn Wroc∏aw, FFiL Ânie˝ka,
Nobiles W∏oc∏awek, ICI Pilawa and
TBD D´bica. Except for Ânie˝ka, all of
these companies are controlled by for-
eign capital. Sold production in 2006
was PLN 2,021.8 million. Two-thirds of
sold production was consumed by the
construction market. 
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25. Rubber goods industry and market
64 businesses operated in rubber
goods production in 2006. The aver-
age monthly salary in this sector grew
by nearly 5% in comparison with
2005. The value of sold production of
chemical rubber goods increased by
89% in comparison with 2001. 

26. Plant protection products and fer-
tilizers industry and market

Due to subsidies that Polish farmers
received after EU accession, the
demand for fertilizers grew significant-
ly. In 2006 the consumption of artificial
fertilizers grew by 5,7% in comparison
with 2005. In 2006 prices of mineral
fertilizers grew by 15,5% compared to
2003. 
The largest producers of mineral fertiliz-
ers include Zak∏ady Azotowe Pu∏awy
S.A., Zak∏ady Chemiczne Police S.A.,
Zak∏ady Azotowe K´dzierzyn S.A.,
and Zak∏ady Azotowe w Tarnowie-
MoÊcicach. All of these companies par-
ticipate in the Great Chemical Synthesis
programme. 
The main foreign markets for Polish arti-
ficial fertilizers include Germany,
Denmark, Belgium, Brazil, the Czech
Republic and the USA. Poland, on the
other hand, imports artificial fertilizers
from Belarus, Russia, Germany and
Lithuania. 

27. Chemical fibres industry and mar-
ket

Businesses in chemical fibres produc-
tion are a minority among the overall
number of companies in the chemical
sector. The number of such companies
has not changed over the last four
years. The value of sold production in
the chemical fibres sector has been
growing steadily during the last three
years, and in 2006 was PLN 1,225.4
million. 

28. Plastic goods industry and market
• General characteristics of the plastic

goods industry in Europe
About 10 million people are currently
employed in the European plastics
goods production market. The invest-
ments in EU countries in this sector are
other EUR 10 billion annually. About
38% of demand for overall plastic goods
production comes from the packaging
industry. Second place is held by house-
hold chemical goods, and third place by
the construction materials market. 
Germany is the largest producer of
plastic goods with employment of

300,000 people. The second-largest
producer is France, and the United
Kingdom is third. The usage of plastics

goods in Europe is shown on the fol-
lowing graph. 
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• Polish plastics industry
The value of sold production of plastics
goods in Poland in 2006 was PLN
16,395.1 million, which is twice as
high as in 2001. An upward trend in
employment was reported in this sector,
with average employment growing
from 48,700 people in 2001 to
60,560 in 2006. 

• Main manufacturers of plastic goods
on the Polish market

• Prospects for development of Polish
plastic goods production

It is expected that the demand for plas-
tic goods will grow in the following
years, especially thanks to new export
opportunities. Nevertheless, Polish plas-
tic goods producers have to increase
their investments in technology and
cooperate more closely with R&D cen-
tres. The most important task, however,
is to invest in environmental protection
and recycling. The biggest growth
opportunities in this sector are associat-
ed with further development of markets
for isolative materials, pipe systems,
windows and others plastics products
for construction. 

29. Prospects for the Polish chemical
industry

The chemical industry sector will face
sustained development in the next
years. The greatest opportunities for the
sector are associated with packaging
production, pharmaceuticals and plas-
tic materials for construction. The sector
requires continuous investments in tech-
nology and research, however. Poland
as a member state of the European
Union is in the course of implementing
the EU directives for environmental pro-
tection, which may increase production
costs at some point. 

Main manufacturers of plastic goods on the Polish market

Main investors
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